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Hospitals and health systems — as anchor orga-

nizations, or economic engines that tend to remain 
in regions where they are established — have the 
opportunity to meet this challenge of improving 
the health of individuals and their neighborhoods 
by making meaningful upstream investments to 
improve community health. While these orga-
nizations have a long history of providing more 
than stand-alone acute care services by contrib-
uting crucial services in communities, innovative 
approaches are needed to address systemic barri-
ers to create truly thriving environments. Apply-
ing strategies from across sectors, such as com-
munity development and investing, may activate 
systemic change that health care-driven strategies 
have not yet been able to accomplish.

The Accelerating Investments for Healthy 
Communities initiative of the Center for Com-
munity Investment is addressing systemic bar-
riers by helping a group of hospitals and health 
systems already investing in affordable housing 
expand the scale and impact of their work, using a 
defined framework.

HEALTH AND HOUSING
Given the inextricable link between affordable, 
quality housing and good health, housing is one 
area that hospitals are starting to focus on more 
and more. Existing and emerging affordable hous-
ing initiatives are designed to address the grow-
ing mismatch between people’s income levels and 
housing costs by preserving or building homes 
that are not being produced by traditional mar-

ket dynamics. Many of these initiatives focus on 
disadvantaged communities where the need is 
great but the conventional market is not able to 
meet that demand. However, funding streams that 
hospitals have historically used for contributing 
to the community, such as community or philan-
thropic grants, may be neither sustainable nor 
adequate for scaling the project or truly revital-
izing the community.

That’s where upstream investment comes into 
play. Investing—paying for goods and services 
that will have value over time, with the expec-
tation of some form of return—as compared to 
spending is an emerging tactic for addressing 
social determinants of health. An overall system 
of community investment has developed to help 
overcome market failures and transform disad-
vantaged communities. Hospital-driven invest-
ment in affordable housing initiatives can con-
tribute to this system.

The Center for Community Investment at 
the Lincoln Institute of Land Policy has devel-
oped a “capital absorption framework” to help 
improve a community’s ability to attract needed 
resources. By working through three core func-
tions — establishing shared priorities, creating 
a pipeline of investable projects and strengthen-
ing investment — communities can engage new 
stakeholders, attract new capital and increase 
the speed and scale of investments. This frame-
work helps hospitals and health systems assess 
their local community investment system. In turn 
they can explore potential roles in bringing new 
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ideas, assets and partnerships to help strengthen 
the system and accelerate efforts to address the 
social determinants of health.

ACCELERATING INVESTMENTS 			 
FOR HEALTHY COMMUNITIES
With support from the Robert Wood Johnson 
Foundation, the Center for Community Invest-
ment launched the Accelerating Investments for 
Healthy Communities initiative to help a group 
of hospitals and health systems already invest-
ing in affordable housing expand the scale and 
impact of their work, using the capital absorption 
framework. The focus is on a cohort of hospitals 
and health systems to better understand what it 
takes to get started on this work and any barriers 
to implementation.

As evaluation partners on the project, the 
American Hospital Association and a nonpar-
tisan research institution, NORC at the Univer-
sity of Chicago, are following the cohort to gain 
insight into what it takes for hospitals to do this 
work. During the initial phase, the participating 
hospitals were introduced to the capital absorp-
tion framework and the concept of community 
investment. The American Hospital Association 
and NORC identified two emerging themes for 
getting buy-in and making the case for investing in 
affordable housing: mission-driven commitment 
and strategic alignment.

 Mission-driven commitment: All partici-
pating hospitals and health systems demonstrated 
an underlying commitment and drive to address 
the social determinants of health, with an empha-
sis on housing. They expressed widespread accep-
tance that, if their goal were to advance equity 
and improve health, it was their responsibility to 
support their communities. This mission-driven 
commitment was linked to certain characteristics 
of the different types of hospitals and health sys-
tems, including anchor organizations, nonprofit, 
safety-net and faith-based.

 Strategic alignment with payment and care 
models: While mission is a driving factor, the old 
mantra, “no margin, no mission” also applies for 
many. New care delivery and payment models 
are creating the strategic alignment to augment 
support for affordable housing. Participating hos-
pitals described how affordable housing aligned 
with their organization’s strategy, particularly 
when they had a health insurance plan or account-
able care organization.

As part of its work providing technical assis-
tance to the Accelerating Investments for Healthy 
Communities sites, The Center for Community 
Investment identified other factors that influence 
hospitals’ and health systems’ work investing in 
affordable housing. In addition to achieving return 
on investment and advancing their mission, these 
organizations view upstream investments as ways 
to enhance their reputation and competitiveness, 
strengthen community relationships, meet their 
obligations to the community and leverage their 
assets to move strategically toward a health care 
future focused more on value than volume.

Over the next two years, project partners in the 
healthy communities work will continue examin-
ing what drives hospitals and health systems to 
invest in affordable housing and what makes these 
projects successful. This work may serve as a path 
forward for other health care organizations look-
ing to invest in addressing the social determinants 
of health.
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